

CHARLEVOIX COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

2017 23A Aggregate Bid Tabulations

February 24, 2017

DESCRIPTION	RIETH-RILEY CONSTRUCTION	J & N, L.L.C.	PAYNE & DOLAN, INC.	MDC CONTRACTING	TEAM ELMERS
	Price Per Ton	Price Per Ton		Price Per Ton	Price Per Ton
0 to 5,000 Ton of 23A Agg. At Contractor Specified Owned/Leased Location	\$6.25	No Bid	\$5.20	\$5.40	\$6.75
Stockpile Location	Hudson Pit		Warner Township Loading Done by Others	Ranney Rd. Pit	Hersha Pit
Stockpile 23A Aggregate at Boyne City Garage					
0 - 2000 Ton Stockpiled of 23A Aggregate at Boyne City Garage	\$9.10	\$9.95	No Bid	\$10.35	\$11.22
Stockpile 23A Afton at Boyne City Garage					
0 - 500 Ton Stockpiled 23A Afton Stone at Boyne City Garage	\$11.52	\$11.65	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Stockpile 23A Aggregate at Ironton Garage					
0 - 500 Ton Stockpiled 23A Aggregate at Ironton Garage	\$11.73	\$11.20	No Bid	\$9.30	\$10.64
Stockpile 23A Afton Stone at Ironton Garage					
0 - 300 Ton Stockpiled 23A Afton Stone at Ironton Garage	\$12.71	\$13.70	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Contact Name	Brad Shearer	Chris Markovich	Gery Hartman	Vince Carpenter	James Carey
Phone Number	(231) 439-5757	(989) 350-6771	(989) 731-0700	(231) 547-6595	(231) 943-3443
Fax Number	(231) 347-8862	(989) 731-1729	(989) 731-0703	(231) 547-9171	(231) 943-5508

CHARLEVOIX COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

2017 Bulk Diesel Fuel Bid Tabulations

February 24, 2017

			CRYSTAL FLASH	
Approximate Gallons	Cost Over Rack	Premium Treatment Rate (Per Gallon)		
52,000 Gallons @ Ironton Garage (FOB)	\$0.0995 + treatment	\$0.03 (Ignite) \$0.055 (Ignite 50)		
Payment Terms	Net 10 Days; 1/3% EFT Next Day			
Bidder Notes				
Contact Name	Jim Tefft			
Phone Number	(616) 363-4851			
Fax Number	(616) 363-7130			

CHARLEVOIX COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

2017 Cold Patch Material Bid Tabulations

February 24, 2017

Location	EVERETT GOODRICH TRUCKING		ACE - SAGINAW PAVING COMPANY	
	Price Per Ton	3/8-Inch Agg.	Price Per Ton	3 1/4 Agg.
500 Ton at Boyne City Garage (FOB)	\$95.00		\$95.54	
500 Ton at Ironton Garage (FOB)	\$95.00		\$95.83	
Oil Type Used	U.P.M.		QPR High Performance	
Payment Terms	30 Days		30 Days	
Bidder Notes				
Contact Name	Bruce Goodrich		Nathan Gotts	
Phone Number	(989) 356-1791		(989) 755-8147	
Fax Number	(989) 356-4895		(989) 755-0426	

CHARLEVOIX COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

2017 Culvert Materials Bid Tabulations

February 24, 2017

Culvert Diameter	CADILLAC CULVERT	JENSEN BRIDGE SUPPLY
	Price Per Foot	Price Per Foot
12-inch (16 Gauge)	\$5.40	\$5.50
15-inch (16 Gauge)	\$6.45	\$6.50
18-inch (16 Gauge)	\$8.35	\$8.30
18-inch (14 Gauge)	\$11.25	
24-inch (16 Gauge)	\$10.75	\$10.60
24-inch (14 Gauge)	\$13.95	
36-inch (14 Gauge)	\$22.05	\$21.40
Minimum Load		Any Quantity
Payment Terms	Prices firm for 120 days	1% - 10 Days; Net 30 Days Prices firm until June 30, 2017. After June 30, 2017 prices will be reviewed for possible increases/decrease relative to current steel market conditions
Contact Name	Dave Galvin	Roger Lodrig
Phone Number	(231) 775-3761 Ext. 106	(810) 648-3000
Fax Number	(231) 775-0072	(810) 648-3549

CHARLEVOIX COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

2017 Dust Control Bid Tabulations

February 24, 2017

LOCATION	38 % CALCIUM CHLORIDE		
	BECKMAN PRODUCTION Price Per Gallon	MICHIGAN CHLORIDE SALES Price Per Gallon	LIQUID CALCIUM CHLORIDE Price Per Gallon
Delivered to Contractor supplied storage tanker at Boyne City and Ironton Garages	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Continuous Appl. (B.C.)	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.647
Continuous Appl. (Ironton)	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.647
Spot Application (B.C.)	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.667
Spot Application (Ironton)	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.667
Beaver Island Cont. Appl.	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.953
Beaver Island Spot Appl.	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.953
26% MINERAL BRINE			
Delivered to Contractor supplied storage tanker at Boyne City and Ironton Garages	\$0.189	\$0.200	No Bid
Continuous Appl. (B.C.)	\$0.209	\$0.220	No Bid
Continuous Appl. (Ironton)	\$0.209	\$0.220	No Bid
Spot Application (B.C.)	\$0.209	\$0.240	No Bid
Spot Application (Ironton)	\$0.209	\$0.240	No Bid
Beaver Island Cont. Appl.	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Beaver Island Spot Appl.	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Bidder Notes			
Contact Names	Robert Conrad	Brad Harkness	Rodney Gerard
Phone Number	(231) 620-1535	(989) 681-3221	(989) 684-5860
Fax Number	(231) 885-2396	(989) 681-3574	(989) 684-9953

CHARLEVOIX COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

2017 Bituminous Materials Bid Tabulations

February 24, 2017

Description	BIT-MAT PRODUCTS		MICHIGAN PAVING & MATERIALS COMPANY		ASPHALT MATERIALS, INC.
	Price Per Gallon		Price Per Gallon		Price Per Gallon
HFRS-2	\$1.90		\$1.99		\$2,1211
AE-90	\$2.00		\$2.04		\$2,1211
Minimum Load (Gallons)	9,000 Gallons		5,400 Gallons		5,400 Gallons
Demurrage	3 HRS. Free; \$92/HR. After		3 HRS. Free for greater than 9,000 Gallons 2 HRS. Free for less than 9,000 Gallons \$90/Hr after free time		2 HRS. Free; \$90/HR. After
Cost For Returned Loads	1-1/2 outbound freight or \$200 Min.		1-1/2 the outbound rate; Minimum \$200 Charge		1 1/2 Times Rate
Payment Terms	Net 30 Days		Net 30 Days		Net 30 Days
Bidder Notes			Alternate Bid for AE-90 is AMS SEAL SP		
Contact Name	Gary Chapman		Frank Azzopardi		Clarence Brooks, Jr.
Phone Number	(989) 684-0341		(989) 402-5932		(419) 693-0626
Fax Number	(989) 684-1033		(989) 402-5583		(419) 693-1069

CHARLEVOIX COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

2017 Pavement Marking Bid Tabulations

February 24, 2017

ITEM	M & M PAVEMENT MARKINGS Price Per Lin. Ft.	MICHIGAN PAVEMENT MARKINGS Price Per Lin. Ft.	P.K. CONTRACTING Price Per Lin. Ft.
Waterborne Dry Pavement Markings - 4" White	\$0.040	\$0.0415	\$0.042
Waterborne Dry Pavement Markings - 6" White	\$0.060	\$0.0610	\$0.060
Waterborne Dry Pavement Markings - 4" Yellow	\$0.040	\$0.0425	\$0.044
SPECIAL PAVEMENT MARKINGS	PRICE EACH	PRICE EACH	PRICE EACH
Railroad Crossing Symbol (Waterborne)	\$100.00	\$100.00	\$100.00
24" Stop Bar Per Foot (Waterborne)	\$2.00	\$2.00	\$1.70
School Symbol (Waterborne)	\$70.00	\$70.00	\$75.00
Bidder Notes			
Contact Name	David Lawler	Shannon Nielsen	Doug Kinkema
Phone Number	(810) 691-7686	(616) 261-3111	(231) 839-4430
Fax Number	(810) 695-4684	(616) 261-3150	(231) 839-4737

CHARLEVOIX COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

2017 Seal Coat Bid Tabulations

February 24, 2017

ITEM	EVERETT GOODRICH TRUCKING, INC.		ELMER'S CRANE & DOZER, INC.	FISHER TRANSPORTATION COMPANY, INC.
	Price Per Ton	Price Per Ton		
29A Natural Stone	\$20.80 Boyne City (AWI 319)	\$22.30 Ironton (AWI 319)	\$25.87	\$34.77
H-1 Limestone Chips (1/4-Inch)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$33.77
Payment Terms	30 Days	30 Days	30 Days	30 Days
Bidder Notes				
Contact Name	Bruce Goodrich	James Carey	Doug Moore	
Phone Number	(989) 356-1791	(231) 943-3443	(989) 773-1376	
Fax Number	(989) 356-4895	(231) 943-5508	(989) 773-7640	

CHARLEVOIX COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

2017 Underbody Scraper & Grader Blade Bid Tabulations

February 24, 2017

DESCRIPTION	NUMBER OF BLADES	TRUCK & TRAILER		WINTER EQUIPMENT COMPANY, INC.		VALK MANUFACTURING
		Price Per Foot		Price Per Foot		
Flame Hardened X-TRA-EDGE Blades						
GB8-2013 or 5/8"-7/8" x 8" x 72"	150	\$16.64		\$11.10*		\$16.90*
X-TRA-EDGE Flame Hardened						
GB8-2072 or 5/8"-7/8" x 8" x 84"	50	\$17.63		\$11.10*		\$16.90*
X-TRA-EDGE Flame Hardened						
Flame Hardened Blades (SBC)						
3/4" x 6" x 72" SBC Flame Hardened* (Alternate Blade)	150	\$17.92		\$13.50		\$15.88
GB5-2101 or 3/4" x 6" x 72"	50	\$14.40		\$8.19		\$11.65
GB5-2008 or 3/4" x 8" x 84**	50	\$18.13		\$13.50		\$11.65
Serrated Blades (Curved Double Bevel)						
GB4-1180 or 3/4" x 8" x 84" Serrated Blade*	10	\$12.84		\$15.63		\$18.70
Wing Plow Blades						
X300582 5/8" x 8" 108" CSB	12	\$12.66		\$11.11		\$8.88
TTWS Hardened Wing Show (73lbs)	12	\$149.49 each		No Bid		\$8.88
Loader Cutting Edges						
107-3746 (Cat Loader Edges)	4	\$174.87 each		\$123.79 each		\$203.15 each
110-4711 (Cat Loader Edges)	4	\$169.25 each		\$125.82 each		\$206.14 each
4T8091 (Cat Loader Buckets Blade End Bits)	4	\$59.17 each		\$38.76 each		\$48.03 each
Minimum Load		25,000lbs or more order		5,000lbs order for free freight. Under 5,000lbs \$120 freight charge.		
Payment Terms		Net 30 Days		Net 30		Net 30
Bidder Notes		If order is placed before March 31 and reaches 38,000lbs, a 5% discount will be deducted from the order. Includes blades only; not shoes.		*Bidding on through hardened 5/8" blades. **All blades quoted are double bevel blades.		*Bidding on 1" x 8" Thru-hardened
Contact Name		Nadine Cone-Baker		Sanja Lijak		Ted Valk
Phone Number		(231) 549-3500		(440) 946-8377		(717) 766-0711
Fax Number		(231) 549-3555		(888) 810-9363		(717) 795-9830

CHARLEVOIX COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

2017 Hot Mix Asphalt Material Bid Tabulations

February 24, 2017

Location	PAYNE & DOLAN, INC.	RIETH-RILEY CONSTRUCTION
	Price Per Ton	Price Per Ton
0 - 500 Ton	\$49.50	\$54.00
Plant Location	Warner Township	Hudson
Contact Name	Gery Hartman	Mark Wagner
Phone Number	(989) 731-0700	(231) 439-5757
Fax Number	(989) 731-0703	(231) 347-8862