

CHARLEVOIX COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

2018 23A Aggregate Bid Tabulations

February 23, 2018

DESCRIPTION	RIETH-RILEY CONSTRUCTION	PAYNE & DOLAN, INC.	MDC CONTRACTING	TEAM ELMERS	BEN SACKRIDER	POQUETTE LEASING
	Price per Ton		Price Per Ton	Price Per Ton	Price Per Ton	Price Per Ton
0 to 5,000 Ton of 23A Agg. At Contractor Specified Owned/Leased Location	\$7.25	\$5.50	\$5.50	\$6.75	No Bid	No Bid
Stockpile Location	Hudson Pit	Warner Township	Ranney Rd. Pit	Hersha Pit		
Stockpile 23A Aggregate at Boyne City Garage						
0 - 2000 Ton Stockpiled of 23A Aggregate at Boyne City Garage	\$10.12	No Bid	\$10.45	\$11.19	\$9.80	\$10.52
Stockpile 23A Afton at Boyne City Garage						
0 - 500 Ton Stockpiled 23A Afton Stone at Boyne City Garage	\$11.67	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$11.40	\$12.02
Stockpile 23A Aggregate at Ironton Garage						
0 - 500 Ton Stockpiled 23A Aggregate at Ironton Garage	\$12.75	No Bid	\$9.85	\$10.61	\$11.30	No Bid
Stockpile 23A Afton Stone at Ironton Garage						
0 - 300 Ton Stockpiled 23A Afton Stone at Ironton Garage	\$12.86	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$12.65	\$12.60
Contact Name	Brad Shearer	Gery Hartman	Vince Carpenter	James Carey	Ben Sackrider	John Poquette
Phone Number	(231) 439-5757	(989) 731-0700	(231) 547-6595	(231) 943-3443	(231) 357-2788	(231) 347-8770
Fax Number	(231) 347-8862	(989) 731-0703	(231) 547-9171	(231) 943-5508	(231) 347-8300	(231) 347-8783

CHARLEVOIX COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

2018 Bulk Diesel Fuel Bid Tabulations

February 23, 2018

CRYSTAL FLASH			
Approximate Gallons	<table border="1"> <tr> <th>Cost Over Rack</th> <th>Premium Treatment Rate (Per Gallon)</th> </tr> </table>	Cost Over Rack	Premium Treatment Rate (Per Gallon)
Cost Over Rack	Premium Treatment Rate (Per Gallon)		
52,000 Gallons @ Ironton Garage (FOB)	<table border="1"> <tr> <td>\$0.1170 + treatment</td> <td> \$0.025 (Premium) \$0.06 (Premium 50) </td> </tr> </table>	\$0.1170 + treatment	\$0.025 (Premium) \$0.06 (Premium 50)
\$0.1170 + treatment	\$0.025 (Premium) \$0.06 (Premium 50)		
Payment Terms	Net 10 Days; 1/3% EFT Next Day		
Bidder Notes			
Contact Name	Jim Tefft		
Phone Number	(616) 363-4851		
Fax Number	(616) 363-7130		

CHARLEVOIX COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

2018 Cold Patch Material Bid Tabulations

February 23, 2018

Location	EVERETT GOODRICH TRUCKING	RIETH-RILEY CONSTRUCTION	ACE - SAGINAW PAVING COMPANY
	Price Per Ton	Price Per Ton	Price Per Ton
	3/8-Inch Agg.	3 1/4 Agg.	3 1/4 Agg.
500 Ton at Boyne City Garage (FOB)	\$97.00	\$95.50	\$101.50
500 Ton at Ironton Garage (FOB)	\$97.00	\$97.00	\$102.00
Oil Type Used	U.P.M.	Bondex High Performance	QPR High Performance
Payment Terms	30 Days	30 Days	30 Days
Bidder Notes		Product is a 3 1/4 Modified	
Contact Name	Bruce Goodrich	James Pemberton	Nathan Gotts
Phone Number	(989) 356-1791	(231) 439-5757	(989) 755-8147
Fax Number	(989) 356-4895	(231) 347-8862	(989) 755-0426

CHARLEVOIX COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

2018 Culvert Materials Bid Tabulations

February 23, 2018

Culvert Diameter	CADILLAC CULVERT	JENSEN BRIDGE SUPPLY	ST. REGIS CULVERT
	Price Per Foot	Price Per Foot	Price Per Foot
12-inch (16 Gauge)	\$5.90	\$5.90	\$6.00
15-inch (16 Gauge)	\$7.00	\$7.05	\$7.10
18-inch (16 Gauge)	\$8.55	\$8.65	\$8.60
18-inch (14 Gauge)	\$10.45	\$10.86	\$10.80
24-inch (16 Gauge)	\$11.00	\$11.20	\$11.25
24-inch (14 Gauge)	\$14.66	\$14.80	\$15.10
36-inch (14 Gauge)	\$22.70	\$22.70	\$24.50
Minimum Load	N/A	Any Quantity	\$5,000 to include freight
Payment Terms	Prices firm for 90 days; 1% - 10 Days; Net 30 Days	1% - 10 Days; Net 30 Days Prices firm until June 30, 2018. After June 30, 2018 prices will be reviewed for possible increases/decrease relative to current steel market conditions	Net 30 Days Prices firm for 90 days from bid date.
Contact Name	Dave Galvin	Roger Loding	Chris Mooney
Phone Number	(231) 250-4638	(810) 648-3000	(517) 543-3430
Fax Number	(231) 775-0072	(810) 648-3549	(517) 543-2313

CHARLEVOIX COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

2018 Dust Control Bid Tabulations

February 23, 2018

38 % CALCIUM CHLORIDE			
LOCATION	BECKMAN PRODUCTION	MICHIGAN CHLORIDE SALES	LIQUID CALCIUM CHLORIDE
	Price Per Gallon	Price Per Gallon	Price Per Gallon
Delivered to Contractor supplied storage tanker at Boyne City and Ironton Garages	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Continious Appl. (B.C.)	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.651
Continious Appl. (Ironton)	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.651
Spot Application (B.C.)	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.671
Spot Application (Ironton)	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.671
Beaver Island Cont. Appl.	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.969
Beaver Island Spot Appl.	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.969
26% MINERAL BRINE			
Delivered to Contractor supplied storage tanker at Boyne City and Ironton Garages	\$0.189	\$0.200	No Bid
Continious Appl. (B.C.)	\$0.209	\$0.220	No Bid
Continious Appl. (Ironton)	\$0.209	\$0.220	No Bid
Spot Application (B.C.)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Spot Application (Ironton)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Beaver Island Cont. Appl.	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Beaver Island Spot Appl.	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Bidder Notes			
Contact Names	Robert Conrad	Brad Harkness	Rodney Gerard
Phone Number	(231) 620-1535	(989) 681-3221	(989) 684-5860
Fax Number	(231) 885-2396	(989) 681-3574	(989) 684-9953

CHARLEVOIX COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

2018 Bituminous Materials Bid Tabulations

February 23, 2018

Description	BIT-MAT PRODUCTS OF MICHIGAN	MICHIGAN PAVING & MATERIALS COMPANY
	Price Per Gallon	Price Per Gallon
HFRS-2	\$1.90	\$1.99 for HFRS-2 \$2.15 for HFRS-2M
AE-90	\$2.00	\$1.95 AMS Seal SP
Minimum Load (Gallons)	9,000 Gallons	5,000
Demurrage	3 HRS. Free; \$92/HR. After	3 HRS. Free for greater than 9,000 Gallons 2 HRS. Free for less than 9,000 Gallons \$90/Hr after free time
Cost For Returned Loads	1-1/2 outbound freight or \$200 Min.	1-1/2 the outbound rate; Minimum \$200 Charge
Payment Terms	Net 30 Days	Net 30 Days
Bidder Notes		Alternate Bid for AE-90 is AMS SEAL SP
Contact Name	Gary Chapman	Russ Milian
Phone Number	(989) 684-0341	(989) 402-5932
Fax Number	(989) 684-1033	(989) 402-5583

CHARLEVOIX COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

2018 Pavement Marking Bid Tabulations

February 23, 2018

ITEM	P.K. CONTRACTING Price Per Lin. Ft.	MICHIGAN PAVEMENT MARKINGS, LLC. Price Per Lin. Ft.	M & M PAVEMENT MARKINGS Price Per Lin. Ft.
Waterborne Dry Pavement Markings - 4" White	\$0.040	\$0.04	\$0.04
Waterborne Dry Pavement Markings - 6" White	\$0.057	\$0.06	\$0.06
Waterborne Dry Pavement Markings - 4" Yellow	\$0.040	\$0.04	\$0.04
SPECIAL PAVEMENT MARKINGS	PRICE EACH	PRICE EACH	PRICE EACH
Railroad Crossing Symbol (Waterborne)	\$100.00	\$90.00	\$100.00
24" Stop Bar Per Foot (Waterborne)	\$1.70	\$1.50	\$2.00
School Symbol (Waterborne)	\$75.00	\$65.00	\$70.00
Bidder Notes			
Contact Name	Doug Kinkema	Shannon Nielsen	David Lawler
Phone Number	(231) 839-4430	(616) 261-3111	(810) 691-7686
Fax Number	(231) 839-4737	(616) 261-3150	(810) 695-4684

CHARLEVOIX COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

2018 Seal Coat Bid Tabulations

February 23, 2018

ITEM	EVERETT GOODRICH TRUCKING, INC.		ELMER'S CRANE & DOZER, INC.		FISHER TRANSPORTATION COMPANY, INC.
	Price Per Ton		Price Per Ton		Price Per Ton
29A Natural Stone	\$21.65 Boyne City (AWI 319)	\$23.10 Irononton (AWI 319)	\$27.75 Boyne City (AWI 258)	\$25.25 Irononton (AWI 258)	\$35.46
H-1 Limestone Chips (1/4-Inch)	No Bid		\$33.63 Boyne City	\$32.54 Irononton	\$34.46
Payment Terms	30 Days from invoice		30 Days		30 Days
Bidder Notes					
Contact Name	Bruce Goodrich		James Carey		Doug Moore
Phone Number	(989) 356-1791		(231) 943-3443		(989) 773-1376
Fax Number	(989) 356-4895		(231) 943-5508		(989) 773-7640

CHARLEVOIX COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

2018 Hot Mix Asphalt Material Bid Tabulations

February 23, 2018

Location	PAYNE & DOLAN, INC.	RIETH-RILEY CONSTRUCTION
	Price Per Ton	Price Per Ton
0 - 500 Ton	\$49.50	\$55.00
Plant Location	Warner Pic, Elmira Township	Hudson Township
Contact Name	Gery Hartman	Mark Wagner
Phone Number	(989) 731-0700	(231) 439-5757
Fax Number	(989) 731-0703	(231) 347-8862