

CHARLEVOIX COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

2019 23A Aggregate Bid Tabulations

February 22, 2019

DESCRIPTION	RIETH-RILEY CONSTRUCTION	PAYNE & DOLAN, INC.	MDC CONTRACTING	TEAM ELMERS		POQUETTE LEASING
	Price per Ton		Price Per Ton	Price Per Ton	Price Per Ton	Price Per Ton
0 to 5,000 Ton of 23A Agg. At Contractor Specified Owned/Leased Location	\$7.50	\$5.75 County Provides Loader	\$6.20	\$6.75	\$7.50	No Bid
Stockpile Location	Hudson Pit	Warner Township	Ranney Rd. Pit	Hersha Pit	Fall Park Rd.	
Stockpile 23A Aggregate at Boyne City Garage						
0 - 2000 Ton Stockpiled of 23A Aggregate at Boyne City Garage	No Bid	No Bid	\$10.55	\$11.19		\$11.57
Stockpile 23A Afton at Boyne City Garage						
0 - 500 Ton Stockpiled 23A Afton Stone at Boyne City Garage	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$14.73		\$13.03
Stockpile 23A Aggregate at Ironton Garage						
0 - 500 Ton Stockpiled 23A Aggregate at Ironton Garage	No Bid	No Bid	\$10.10	\$9.90		No Bid
Stockpile 23A Afton Stone at Ironton Garage						
0 - 300 Ton Stockpiled 23A Afton Stone at Ironton Garage	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$19.47		\$14.21
Contact Name	Brad Shearer	Gery Hartman	Vince Carpenter	James Carey		Jerry Gravedoni
Phone Number	(231) 439-5757	(989) 731-0700	(231) 547-6595	(231) 943-3443		(231) 347-8770
Fax Number	(231) 347-8862	(989) 731-0703	(231) 547-9171	(231) 943-5508		(231) 347-8783

CHARLEVOIX COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

2019 Bulk Diesel Fuel Bid Tabulations

February 22, 2019

	BLARNEY CASTLE OIL CO.		DERRER & SONS OIL COMPANY		CRYSTAL FLASH, INC.	
	Cost Over Rack	Premium Treatment Rate (Per Gallon)	Cost Over Rack	Premium Treatment Rate (Per Gallon)	Cost Over Rack	Premium Treatment Rate (Per Gallon)
Approximate Gallons						
52,000 Gallons @ Ironton Garage (FOB)	\$0.105 + treatment	\$0.025 (Diesel Guard) \$0.05 (Diesel Guard Plus-50 Cetane)	Cheboygan: \$0.06 + treatment Ferrysburg: \$0.12 + treatment Holland: \$0.13 + treatment	\$0.035 (Power Max Plus) \$0.075 (Power Max 50 cetane)	\$0.1223 + treatment	\$0.025 (Premium) \$0.06 (Permium 50 cetane)
Payment Terms	Net 10 Days		Net 10 Days		Net 10 Days	
Bidder Notes			Will use the location providing the cheapest fuel.			
Contact Name	Dennis P. McCarthy		Dennis Derrer		Jim Tefft	
Phone Number	(231) 864-3488 Ext. 110		(231) 587-9179		(616) 363-4851	
Fax Number	(231) 864-2303		(231) 587-8083		(616) 363-7130	

CHARLEVOIX COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

2019 Cold Patch Material Bid Tabulations

February 22, 2019

Location	EVERETT GOODRICH TRUCKING		RIETH-RILEY CONSTRUCTION		UNIQUE PAVING MATERIALS, CORP.	
	Price Per Ton	Price Per Ton	Price Per Ton	Price Per Ton	Price Per Ton	Price Per Ton
	29A Aggregate	31A Aggregate	29A Aggregate	31A Aggregate	29A Aggregate	31A Aggregate
500 Ton at Boyne City Garage (FOB)	\$95.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$102.00	No Bid	\$113.64
500 Ton at Ironton Garage (FOB)	\$97.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$103.50	No Bid	\$115.22
Oil Type Used	QPR		To Be Determined		UPM Liquid Blend	
Payment Terms	30 Days From Invoice		30 Days From Invoice		30 Days	
Bidder Notes			50 Ton loads			
Contact Name	Bruce Goodrich		James Pemberton		Sonya Flanagan	
Phone Number	(989) 356-1791		(231) 439-5757		(231) 883-3030	
Fax Number	(989) 356-4895		(231) 347-8862		(231) 266-8091	

CHARLEVOIX COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

2019 Culvert Materials Bid Tabulations

February 22, 2019

Culvert Diameter	CADILLAC CULVERT	JENSEN BRIDGE SUPPLY	ST. REGIS CULVERT
	Price Per Foot	Price Per Foot	Price Per Foot
12-inch (16 Gauge)	\$6.40	\$6.53	\$6.55
15-inch (16 Gauge)	\$7.80	\$8.30	\$8.00
18-inch (16 Gauge)	\$9.80	\$10.00	\$10.00
18-inch (14 Gauge)	\$12.25	\$12.30	\$13.25
24-inch (16 Gauge)	\$11.95	\$12.49	\$13.30
24-inch (14 Gauge)	\$16.10	\$16.15	\$17.64
36-inch (14 Gauge)	\$23.50	\$24.91	\$26.46
Minimum Load	N/A	Any Quantity	\$6,500 to include freight
Payment Terms	Prices firm for 120 days; 1% - 10 Days; Net 30 Days	1% - 10 Days; Net 30 Days Prices firm for 90 days. After 90 days prices will be reviewed for possible increas/decrease relative to current steel market conditions	Net 30 Days Prices firm for 90 days from bid date.
Contact Name	Dave Galvin	Roger Loding	Chris Mooney
Phone Number	(231) 775-3761	(810) 648-3000	(517) 543-3430
Fax Number	(231) 775-0072	(810) 648-3549	(517) 543-2313

CHARLEVOIX COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

2019 Dust Control Bid Tabulations

February 22, 2019

38 % CALCIUM CHLORIDE			
LOCATION	BECKMAN PRODUCTION	MICHIGAN CHLORIDE SALES	LIQUID CALCIUM CHLORIDE
	Price Per Gallon	Price Per Gallon	Price Per Gallon
Delivered to Contractor supplied storage tanker at Boyne City and Ironton Garages	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Continious Appl. (B.C.)	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.67
Continious Appl. (Ironton)	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.67
Spot Application (B.C.)	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.69
Spot Application (Ironton)	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.69
Beaver Island Cont. Appl.	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.986
Beaver Island Spot Appl.	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.986
26% MINERAL BRINE			
Delivered to Contractor supplied storage tanker at Boyne City and Ironton Garages	\$0.20	No Bid	No Bid
Continious Appl. (B.C.)	\$0.22	\$0.25	No Bid
Continious Appl. (Ironton)	\$0.22	\$0.25	No Bid
Spot Application (B.C.)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Spot Application (Ironton)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Beaver Island Cont. Appl.	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Beaver Island Spot Appl.	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Bidder Notes			
Contact Names	Clint Cook	Karen Vandooren	Rodney Gerard
Phone Number	(231) 885-1665	(989) 681-3221	(989) 684-5860
Fax Number	(231) 885-2396	(989) 681-3574	(989) 684-9953

CHARLEVOIX COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

2019 Bituminous Materials Bid Tabulations

February 22, 2019

	ASPHALT MATERIALS, INC.	BIT-MAT PRODUCTS OF MICHIGAN	MICHIGAN PAVING & MATERIALS COMPANY
Description	Price Per Gallon	Price Per Gallon	Price Per Gallon
HFRS-2	\$2.12	\$2.13	\$2.40
AE-90	\$2.12	\$2.13	\$2.36 AMS Seal SP
Minimum Load (Gallons)	5,500 Gallons	9,000 Gallons	3,000 Gallons
Demurrage	2 HRS. Free; \$110/HR. After	3 HRS. Free; \$92/HR. After	\$100/Hour
Cost For Returned Loads	\$0.54 Per Gallon	1-1/2 outbound freight or \$200 Min.	1-1/2 the outbound rate
Payment Terms	Net 30 Days	Net 30 Days	Net 30 Days
Bidder Notes			Alternate Bid for AE-90 is AMS SEAL SP
Contact Name	Clarence Brooks, Jr.	Gary Chapman	Russ Milan
Phone Number	(419) 693-0626	(989) 684-0341	(989) 402-5932
Fax Number	(419) 693-1069	(989) 684-1033	(989) 402-5583

CHARLEVOIX COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

2019 Pavement Marking Bid Tabulations

February 22, 2019

	P.K. CONTRACTING	M & M PAVEMENT MARKINGS	MICHIGAN PAVEMENT MARKINGS, LLC.
ITEM	Price Per Lin. Ft.	Price Per Lin. Ft.	Price Per Lin. Ft.
Waterborne Dry Pavement Markings - 4" White	\$0.041	\$0.042	\$0.044
Waterborne Dry Pavement Markings - 6" White	\$0.058	\$0.057	\$0.060
Waterborne Dry Pavement Markings - 4" Yellow	\$0.041	\$0.042	\$0.045
SPECIAL PAVEMENT MARKINGS	PRICE EACH	PRICE EACH	PRICE EACH
Railroad Crossing Symbol (Waterborne)	\$100.00	\$100.00	\$100.00
24" Stop Bar Per Foot (Waterborne)	\$1.70	\$2.00	\$1.75
School Symbol (Waterborne)	\$75.00	\$75.00	\$70.00
Bidder Notes			
Contact Name	Doug Kinkema	David Lawler	Shannon Nielsen
Phone Number	(231) 839-4430	(810) 691-7686	(616) 261-3111
Fax Number	(231) 839-4737	(810) 695-4684	(616) 558-0000

CHARLEVOIX COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

2019 Seal Coat Bid Tabulations

February 22, 2019

ITEM	EVERETT GOODRICH TRUCKING, INC.		FISHER TRANSPORTATION COMPANY, INC.
	Price Per Ton		Price Per Ton
29A Natural Stone	\$24.00 Boyne City (AWI 319)	\$26.50 Ironton (AWI 319)	\$36.40
H-1 Limestone Chips (1/4-Inch)	\$28.00 Boyne City (Natural Stone)	\$31.50 Boyne City (Natural Stone)	\$35.40
Payment Terms	30 Days from invoice		30 Days
Bidder Notes			
Contact Name	Bruce Goodrich		Doug Moore
Phone Number	(989) 356-1791		(989) 773-1376
Fax Number	(989) 356-4895		(989) 773-7640

CHARLEVOIX COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

2019 Underbody Scraper & Grader Blade Bid Tabulations

February 22, 2019

DESCRIPTION	NUMBER OF BLADES	TRUCK & TRAILER		WINTER EQUIPMENT COMPANY, INC.		WEAR PARTS & EQUIPMENT	
		Price Per Blade		Price Per Blade		Price Per Blade	
Flame Hardened X-TRA-EDGE Blades							
GB8-2013 or 5/8"-7/8" x 8" x 72" X-TRA-EDGE Flame Hardened	200	\$125.33		\$87.49*		\$158.64	
GB8-2026 or 5/8"-7/8" x 8" x 84" X-TRA-EDGE Flame Hardened	10	\$144.96		\$102.07*		\$185.09	
Flame Hardened Blades (SBC)							
GB5-2101 or 3/4" x 6" x 72"	50	\$94.41		\$61.93*		\$119.05	
GB5-2008 or 3/4" x 8" x 84"	20	\$136.16		\$102.07*		\$164.64	
Serrated Blades (Curved Double Bevel)							
GB4-1180 or 3/4" x 8" x 84" Serrated Blade*	100	\$68.52		\$64.52		\$65.93	
GB4-1185 or 3/4" x 8" x 84" Serrated Blade*	20	\$142.28		\$116.98		\$124.04	
Wing Plow Blades							
X300582 5/8" x 8" 108" CSB	20	\$116.44		\$148.11		\$155.17	
TTWS Hardened Wing Show (73lbs)	48	\$144.94		\$153.51		No Bid	
Front Plow Blades							
Plowshoe-H Single Ear Hardened Front Side Plow Shoes	10	\$105.84		\$135.14		No Bid	
5/8" x 8" x 149" FSE Monroe Blade	4	\$123.55		\$128.85		No Bid	
Sandvic System 2000 Carbide Tips							
	No. of Tips	Price Per Tip	Total Price	Price Per Tip	Total Price	Price Per Tip	Total Price
PS 2244-28FS or MT 10105	325	\$5.81	\$1,888.25	\$6.76	\$2,197.00	\$9.72	\$3,110.40
Minimum Load						\$6,500 minimum blade purchase	
Payment Terms		Net 30 Days		Net 30		Net 30	
Bidder Notes				*All blades quoted are double bevel blades. 4-5 week delivery; N/C Freight.		3-Month price guarantee.	
Contact Name		Rory Diamond		Nate Kallay		Ian Healy	
Phone Number		(231) 549-3500		(800) 294-6837		(303) 287-1966	
Fax Number		(231) 549-3555		(888) 810-9363		(303) 288-2204	

CHARLEVOIX COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

2019 Hot Mix Asphalt Material Bid Tabulations

February 22, 2019

Location	PAYNE & DOLAN, INC.	RIETH-RILEY CONSTRUCTION
	Price Per Ton	Price Per Ton
0 - 500 Ton	\$56.00 (4E1)	\$64.00 (4E1) \$72.00 (5E1)
Plant Location	Warner Pit, Elmira Township	Hudson Township
Contact Name	Gery Hartman	Mark Wagner
Phone Number	(989) 731-0700	(231) 439-5757
Fax Number	(989) 731-0703	(231) 347-8862